
  

Mundelein High School is a comprehensive, one-building 

district for grades 9-12. The District covers a 36 square mile 

area and serves the needs of 1,981 students from Munde-

lein and surrounding communities. Mundelein is on Chica-

go’s North Shore, about 40 miles north of Chicago and has 

a population of approximately 33,000 residents. 

In the Fall of 2016, the high school opened its new building 

addition which includes a STEM lab, Project Lead the Way 

instruction, a Business Incubator Laboratory and other fea-

tures that prepare students for the future. 

Recent graduates attend such prestigious schools as Har-

vard, Yale, Duke, Cornell, Boston College, University of Chi-

cago, Stanford, Notre Dame, US Naval Academy, Tulane 

University, NYU, UC Berkeley, Syracuse, George Washing-

ton, Emory University and many others. 

Roughly 85% of graduates continue their education at post

-secondary institutions. The school offers a wide range of 

challenging courses including honors and advanced place-

ment courses, open to all students. The District also offers 

special education services, ELL and bilingual studies. Quali-

fied students may also take courses at the nearby College 

of Lake County and at the Lake County High Schools Tech-

nology Campus. 

 English   4 credits 

 Mathematics  3 credits 

 Science (Laboratory) 2 credits 

 Social Studies  2.5 credits 

 Physical Education 4 credits 

 Electives   7 credits 

 Total Required Credits: 22 credits 

Note:  Mundelein High School no longer provides Class 

Rank for students beginning with the Class of 2021. 

 

  Composite Score—1013 

  Mean ERW Score—509 

  Mean Math Score—504 

 Top 10% of the Class of 2020 Mean Score = 1409 

 Top 15% of Class of 2020 Mean Score = 1374 



 

Regular  Honors  AP Level 

A = 4.0  A = 4.5  A = 5.0 

B = 3.0  B = 3.5  B = 4.0 

C = 2.0  C = 2.5  C = 3.0 

D = 1.0  D = 1.5  D = 2.0 

F = 0.0  F = 0.0  F = 0.0 

For 2020—2021, MHS offers 26 AP courses as follows: 

Art 2D Design Art 3D Design AP Drawing 

Biology  Calculus AB Calculus BC 

Chemistry Computer Sci English Language 

English Lit Environmental Science 

Micro Econ Macro Econ Music Theory 

Physics 1 Psychology Spanish Language 

Statistics  US History US Comp Gov/Politics 

World History 

 

Fall of 2020—2021:    Ethnicity 

     1981 students   Latino              45% 

Grade 9  534  Caucasian           41% 

Grade 10 534  Asian              5.75% 

Grade 11 492  Two or more      6% 

Grade 12 421  Black              2.1% 

    Other              0.15% 

MHS offers more than 45 extracurricular programs, clubs 

and activities as well as a comprehensive athletic program 

of 31 varsity sports for males and females.  

The highly educated staff at MHS exhibit a commitment to 

quality education. Seventy-five percent of the staff have 

earned a masters degree or above. 

 

Mundelein High School District 120 

1350 W Hawley ST; Mundelein, IL  60060 

847.949.2200 

Mary Bledea, Registrar, X1393, FAX 847.388.4712 

Tom Buenik, Guidance Department Chair : X1262;           

FAX 847.949.0599 



 

Business Education 

Business Incubator Laboratory 

 

English 1,2,3,4 

 

Fine Arts 

Drawing/Painting Studio 

Digital Photo Design Studio 

Ceramic Sculpture Studio 

Metals Jewelry Studio 

Advanced Media 

Student Internship 

 

Mathematics 

Algebra 2/Trigonometry 

Geometry 

Pre-Calculus 

 

Music 

Concert Choir 

Jazz Ensemble 

Master Singers 

Symphonic Winds 

Wind Ensemble 

Science 

Advanced Computer Integrated Manufacturing 

Anatomy 

Biology 

Chemistry 

Principles of Engineering 

Physics 

 

Social Studies 

World Studies 

 

World Languages 

French 4 

Spanish 4 

Spanish 5 



 

Mundelein High School offers more than 400 courses in 20+ 

disciplines which include: 

 Art   Music 

 Bilingual Education Science 

 Consumer Science Social Studies 

 Driver Education  Special Education 

 English   Technology 

 ELL Education  Theatre 

 Health   Wellness 

 Journalism  World Languages 

 Math 

 

83.5% attending a two-or four-year college/university 

51% attending a four-year college/university 

32.5% attending a two-year college 

Nearly $3 million in scholarship money accepted by the 

class 

*Based on self-reported data 

*Class of 2020 College Data not yet completely tabulated 

Mundelein High School offers a number of programs that help 

prepare students for the future with “hands-on” work at local 

businesses and/or creating products that they “pitch” to     

business professionals. Two of those programs are: 

The Mundelein High School/MacLean-Fogg Co-op Program is 
a partnership between District 120 and the family-owned Mac-
Lean-Fogg manufacturing company, headquartered on Allan-
son Road in Mundelein. The program is limited to 10 new stu-
dents each year, and requires a two-year commitment begin-
ning in the student’s junior year.  Students are part-time, paid 
employees during the two class periods per school day that 
they attend manufacturing-related, dual-credit classes and on-
the-job training.  The program is designed to give students a 
thorough understanding of the manufacturing environment, 
dual-credit college level courses specific to the industry, valua-
ble hands-on experience and the possibility of post-graduation 
employment (including the opportunity to pursue higher edu-
cation through the employee education program) with Mac-
Lean-Fogg.  
In Honors Business Incubator, students learn about becoming 
true entrepreneurs. Students have the opportunity to create 
and fully develop their own product or service. Real-world  
entrepreneurs and business experts serve as coaches and  
mentors guiding student teams through the process of idea-
tion, market research, and business plan development. Over 
the course of the semester, student teams learn about        
marketing, accounting, human resources, as well as the legal 
aspects of running a business to get them geared up for Pitch 
Week. Pitch Week helps to further fire the entrepreneurial 
spirit by putting student teams in front of actual investors to 
pitch their innovative ideas and win funding to actually pro-
duce their products. 
 


